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Contra Costa Community College District Selects Susan Lamb as Next Diablo 
Valley College President 

  
MARTINEZ, CA – The Contra Costa Community College District (District) has selected 
Susan Lamb as the next president of Diablo Valley College (DVC).  
 
The announcement was made following a nationwide search that began in May 2017. 
Potential candidates were reviewed and four finalists were selected to participate in 
public forums and final interviews last week. 
 
“I was extremely impressed with all four finalists. They are all strong leaders with a 
unique skillset and experiences” said Chancellor Fred Wood. “In the end, I chose Susan 
Lamb because of her deep understanding of the California community colleges and her 
understanding of both DVC and the District, having worked at both Contra Costa 
College and DVC in progressively complex administrative roles. In addition, we will 
benefit from her leadership experience as interim chancellor/president at City College of 
San Francisco where she successfully led that college through financially challenging 
times, the restoration of accreditation, and developed strong partnerships with the 
community.  Those are major accomplishments, and we welcome her back to DVC and 
the District.” 
 
The District will begin negotiating the contract with Ms. Lamb with the goal of placing the 
item on the December 14, 2017, Governing Board meeting agenda for review and 
approval. 
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“I am so pleased and humbled to be selected as the next president of Diablo Valley 
College,” says Ms. Lamb. “My last four years at City College of San Francisco gave me 
the opportunity to learn and grow as a leader, and I am now better prepared to lead 
DVC. I have deep respect and look forward to returning to this great college, and joining 
my colleagues to transform the lives of our students. ” 

### 

Diablo Valley College (DVC) is one of three colleges in the Contra Costa Community 
College District. For nearly 70 years, Diablo Valley College has provided quality 
education to the community it serves. The larger of DVC’s two campuses is located in 
Pleasant Hill while the newer San Ramon Campus serves the south county in 
Dougherty Valley. Between its two campuses, DVC serves more than 22,000 students 
each semester with a wide variety of program options. DVC is not only recognized as 
one of California's best community colleges, but it also leads the state in transfer to four-
year institutions. For more about DVC, visit www.dvc.edu. 
 
The Contra Costa Community College District (CCCCD) is one of the largest multi -
college community college districts in California. The CCCCD serves a population of 
1,019,640 people, and its boundaries encompass all but 48 of the 734-square-mile land 
area of Contra Costa County. The District is home to Contra Costa College in San 
Pablo, Diablo Valley College in Pleasant Hill, Los Medanos College in Pittsburg, as well 
as educational centers in Brentwood and San Ramon.  The District headquarters is 
located in downtown Martinez. 
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